
Catastrophic Event Dream
(through Richard Keltner <hatesonion@ureach.com>)

Please read this entire e-mail, it is very serious. It also is a rather long e-mail as well, so
please be patient. I am sending out this e-mail which contains a dream that I received on
March 24th 2002.

I am a Christian and have been for about 2 years now. I have discovered that many
Christians do not believe in dreams and that's fine. I'm not here to argue with you or
debate. The problem I have is that I have had dreams that come to pass as you will see
further in this e-mail.

My fear is that if this next dream comes to pass the entire country will never be the
same, it involves an Entire American City "being GONE" as it was said to me in the
dream. Gone in what way? I'm not sure. I'm not sure about anything other then the
fact that I am scared about this happening. I could go on and on with my testimony and
other things I would like to share with you, but I feel I should get straight to the
warning dream. In order for you to understand the dream I will also include the
original dream I had on February 19th, 2001 about the World Trade Center Falling. This
dream came to pass on 9-11- 01.

I am not a prophet or anyone trying to make a name for myself, I'm simply someone
who had a dream that God sent to me about the WTC falling. I posted it on the internet
and nobody cared about it until after the fact. This time I am sending out the dream in
e-mail's so you can deal with this warning as well, and the burden will be lifted off of
me somewhat because of (Ezekiel 33:6). I am asking that Christians please pray about
this warning dream and ask God for direction, test this dream please. Maybe it is a false
dream? Maybe not; and ask God to reveal to you a way out of this for America. I am
asking you to test it because I am admitting to you that I am not above deception, its
quite possible that the devil may have given me a false dream, I cannot take the chance
of doing nothing because of the history of warning dreams I have had in the past, I
hope you understand.

----------------------------------------- 

Catastrophic Event Dream received 03-24-02 

I was on the phone with my old boss from a company I worked for about 6 years ago
in the security industry. As I talked to him on the phone I mentioned that he should get
right with God because there was not much time left before the end of the world. As I
explained this I mentioned how I had a dream about the "World Trade Center" falling
down (on Feb 19th 2001) and how it came to pass on 9-11-01, then I added I had a
dream that showed America looking like it had fallen into 3rd World Status.

All of a sudden he said "Wait a minute, my daughter had a similar dream!" Then I was
no longer on the phone with him but in his house looking at his little girl who was
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about 6 or 7 years old. His daughter in real life is now at about 16 years old. As I talked
to him in his house he explained that “He was not a Christian and his daughter wasn't
either so the dream that she had might not be true.” I told him that it says in the Word
of God that the Lord would pour out dreams and visions upon "all flesh" in the end
times.

As I explained this he said his daughter's dream was showing that a Catastrophic event
will be taking place soon that will drag the United States down into a 3rd World
Country Status. I felt as he told me that, this meant an entire city will be disappearing. I
do not know if this means a "Nuclear" or "Chemical" Attack or something else. All that
was clear is that a city will be attacked and that most of the people in this city will be
GONE. This event will bring the country into total devastation.

At the end of the dream I heard Phoenix, Arizona. This does not mean that I am certain
that this is the city that will be targeted for sure because I am not. Maybe God will
confirm it with you.

**Shortly after having this dream me and my friends prayed for confirmation about the
Location and the type of Attack. One of my Christian friends has a daughter who lives
in the Phoenix area, and the same day I got the dream, his daughter received an e-mail
from a man she had only met once on campus with the screen name "FuturePhxFire".
He was a local fireman trainee and college student whose heroes happen to be the 100's
of firemen who recently died in the WTC incident.

Later that day this same friend shared the dream with a Man of God who runs a
Christian room on Pal Talk and before this Man of God could finish praying for my
friend he was overcome with weeping and felt a heaviness in the Spirit of God all over
him and could not fully understand the consequences of this experience except it being
additional confirmation that a terrible judgment was about to unfold on our Nation. 

This Man of God later shared the dream with his 18 year old Christian son and he was
also overcome with weeping and the heaviness of the Spirit of God. Then, that same
evening I went to a prayer meeting and shared it with a Pastor leading prayer who said
God told him 2 weeks ago that a some type of Nuclear Attack will take place in
Arizona, and that he didn't want to say anything, but when I shared the dream he said
he had to talk about it.

So you can see why this needs to be tested by other Christians as soon as possible. If it
is a disaster coming, Christians need to call a Solemn Assembly and ask God to please
show us the way out of this. I honestly believe GOD is calling this Nation to repentance
right now because America's cup of iniquity is overflowing. God is getting ready to
break His Silence again––suddenly. So let’s not be caught off guard, and let’s not fool
ourselves into thinking America is in good standing with God, and that because we
have sided with Israel in many ways that GOD will just forget about the 48 million
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babies slaughtered in abortions since 1973 and many many other sins that have stacked
up against us.

The party is over if this last dream comes to pass. Lets join together and do something
about it as “HIS” church. If churches work together and raise their voices against the
sins of this nation, and call the nation to repentance, I honestly believe disasters like this
dream showed can be stopped or delayed. So please consider saying something to your
Pastor, to leaders now. If Christians work together and take this serious we can prevent
this, if we sit back and have church as usual with useless meetings and conferences
about nothing we are doomed. 

----------------------------------------- 

World Trade Center Dream received 02-19-01 

I was standing at the top of one of the World Trade Center building towers. I was
facing west and was on the south tower, I was able to see everything below me and
everything looked normal.

Suddenly an earthquake below triggered explosions and rumbling. I tried to keep
standing by balancing myself and it felt like being on a surf board.. I heard screaming
like I have never heard before in my life. The North Tower slowly bent itself to a
position where it was leaning in front of me. Something stopped it. It had not fallen but
looked as if it were about too. I could see people screaming through the windows,
saying “Help me please, please help me, help meee!!!” The screaming was something I
cannot explain in this message––it was terrible.

The earth had stopped shaking but both buildings were swaying and unstable. I got on
my knees and prayed: “Father God, In Jesus name please help me out of this my God. I
do not want to die like this dear God, Oh Father save me from this terrible death of
falling to the ground, Father my house is a mess at a home. Don't let me die leaving
such a mess” Amen.

Don't ask me what the house being a mess thing is about. I have a cleaning lady :)

As soon as I got done praying this an old woman dressed in white approached a
window on my left. She was walking on a platform that somehow was raised all the
way to the top of the building. The screaming of many people kept roaring in the
background. It sounded like thousands: some screamed “Oh my GOD, help us please,
help me please!!”

The old woman walked up to some safety window that snapped open and said “come!”
The people screaming could see me leaving the other unstable tower and screamed
even louder now. I said to her, what about all these screaming for their lives? She said
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“They do not know the Father God and will die today just like you see. They will fall to
the ground and nothing can save them”.

End

--------------------------------

Farewell, Your brother in Christ in NY

PS: If this e-mail reached you and you and you have not received Jesus Christ as your
Lord and Savior, please consider that I honestly believe there is not much time left.
Jesus died for you and loves you, but there is going to be a point in time where it may
be too late. I'm not saying this to press you or scare you, I'm only saying it because I
believe it's the truth.

If you have some type of faith in any other religion that rejects Jesus Christ as your
Lord and Savior, or any other faith that adds to the Word of God such as Mormonism
or Jehovah Witnesses you need to please take the time to test it and ask yourself
“Could I be deceived?”

Please renounce these false religions and ask Jesus into your heart. The devil has been
hard at work long before you were born setting up deception to keep you away from
the only atonement for our sins which is the precious blood of Jesus. HIS blood will
wash you from the sin we were born into and committed in our lives.

No other religion in the world deals with sin, they all rely on what YOU can do, and the
truth is you cannot do anything, only the pure precious blood of Jesus can wash us and
set us free, and He shed it for you and suffered for you, for the reason that He knows
you and cares so much for you. He has serious LOVE for you, just receive it, you need
to let HIM come in and show you that you are loved by HIM. Don't look at your
circumstances around you. I did the same thing. I asked myself “why this” and “why
that.” Just let Jesus Christ's love for you answer those questions for you. There are
some things in this world you need to FEEL not so much hear about, and feeling HIS
love answers many questions in a second's time.

Pray this:

Father, it is written in Your Word that if I confess with my mouth that Jesus Christ is
Lord and believe in my heart that You have raised Him from the dead, I shall be saved.
Therefore, Father, I confess that Jesus is my Lord, I make Him Lord of my life right
now. I believe in my heart that You raised Jesus from the dead. I renounce my past life
with Satan and close the door to any of his devices. I thank You for forgiving me of all
my sin. Jesus is my Lord, and I am a new creation. Old things have passed away. Now
all things become new in Jesus' mighty name. Amen
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Father, I realize my helplessness in saving myself, and I glory in what Christ Jesus has
done for me. I let go -- put aside all past sources of my confidence -- counting them
worth less than nothing, in order that I may experience Christ and become one with
Him. Lord, I have received Your Son, and He has given me authority (power, privilege,
and right) to become Your child. I unfold my past and put into proper perspective those
things that are behind. I have been crucified with Christ, and I no longer live, but Christ
lives in me. The life I live in the body, I live by faith in the Son of God, Who loved me
and gave Himself for me. I trust in You, Lord, with all my heart and lean not on my
own understanding. In all my ways I acknowledge You, and you will make my paths
straight. 

I want to know Christ and the power of His resurrection and the fellowship of sharing
in His sufferings, becoming like Him in His death, and so, somehow, to attain to the
resurrection from the dead. So, whatever it takes, I will be one who lives in the flesh
newness of life of those who are alive from the dead. I am bringing all my energies to
bear on this one thing: regardless of my past I look forward to what lies ahead. I strain
to reach the end of the race and receive the prize for which You are calling me up to
Heaven because of what Christ Jesus did for me. In Jesus name I pray, Amen. 

Scripture References John 3:16 - John 14:6 John 6:37 - Romans 10:9,10 John 10:10b -
Romans 10:13 Romans 3:23 - Ephesians 2:1- 10 2 Corinthians 5:19 - 2 Corinthians 5:17
John 16:8,9 - John 1:12 Romans 5:8 - 2 Corinthians 5:21
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